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The current issue of the Ethiopian Journal of Translational Sciences (EJTS) addresses the multifaceted health 
challenges facing low-resource countries such as Ethiopia. It addresses a spectrum of health issues, from molecular 
biomarkers in prostate cancer to the epidemiology of infectious diseases, including childhood diarrhoea and zoonotic 
threats, as well as health system resilience. The issue illustrates how evidence spanning molecular to community levels 
can inform effective public health interventions and policy decisions. 

Cancer remains a growing public health concern in resource-limited settings, where late diagnosis and limited 
treatment options contribute to high morbidity and mortality. Molecular studies investigating DNA mismatch repair 
pathways are essential for understanding cancer pathogenesis, identifying high-risk populations, and developing 
targeted therapies1, which can inform local screening programs and guide evidence-based treatment strategies. 
Advancing molecular insights alongside improved diagnostic infrastructure can significantly strengthen cancer control 
efforts in these contexts. While cancer control requires advanced diagnostics and timely treatment, similar systemic 
gaps affect the management of infectious diseases, where inadequate infrastructure, limited workforce, and resource 
constraints hinder effective prevention and care. 

Infectious diseases such as acute diarrhoea and scabies continue to pose a major burden, particularly among children, 
owing to inadequate water, sanitation, and hygiene (WASH) conditions 2,3. These epidemiological insights can inform 
targeted community interventions and guide local public health policies aimed at disease prevention and control. 
Likewise, zoonotic diseases, such as rabies, remain a persistent threat due to close human-to-animal interactions, 
limited vaccination coverage, and gaps in surveillance 4. Addressing these challenges requires One Health approaches, 
integrating human, animal and environmental health strategies to reduce transmission, prevent and respond outbreaks. 

Furthermore, the health systems in low-income countries face additional human-made vulnerabilities. Conflict and 
political instability disrupt essential services, including disease control programs, resulting in reverses for malaria 
elimination and other public health interventions 5. Strengthening health system resilience and ensuring continuity of 
services are therefore critical for sustaining health gains and mitigating the effects of crises, providing a basis for 
policymakers to design adaptive strategies that maintain essential health services during conflict or instability. 

These challenges underscore the need for a multidisciplinary, multi-sectoral and multiagency approach to prevent and 
control public health important diseases in resource-limited countries. Biomedical and public health research, when 
combined, can provide interventions that address both biological and social determinants. 

In resource-limited countries, health challenges are multifaceted and interconnected. Natural and man-made hazards, 
such as infectious diseases, zoonotic outbreaks, and malaria, intersect with the growing burden of non-communicable 
diseases, including mental health disorders and suicide. These challenges are further exacerbated by conflict and 
political instability, which weaken already fragile health systems. Addressing such complex issues requires lasting 
solutions that translate scientific evidence into practical actions, strengthen health systems, and adopt integrated One 
Health approaches. Through coordinated national and regional efforts, countries like Ethiopia can build more resilient 
health systems and safeguard communities against both current and emerging health threats. 
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